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Harjeet Nath <harjeetnath@tripurauniv.in>

Re: Project ID: PG2019004: Exploring the Potential of Biomass available in NE
India for Biofuel (Synthesis Gas) Production and its further Integration in
Fluidized Bed Gasifier
7 messages

RESEARCH IEI <research@ieindia.org> Thu, Sep 13, 2018 at 5:03 PM
To: Harjeet Nath <harjeetnath@tripurauniv.in>

R.5/2/PG/2018-19/RDPG2018005 [Permanent ID: PG2019004]
 
Dear Sir/Madam,
 
We are pleased to inform you that the sanctioned amount of Rs.25,000/- under IEI R&D Grant-in-Aid scheme
against the subject project has been transferred through NEFT on 12.09.2018 as per Payee Details provided by you.
Transaction Number is AXTB182555587903.
 
Please check with the appropriate authority of your institute and confirm receipt of the amount via mail.

With best regards, 

IEI R&D Cell 
Technical Department 
The Institution of Engineers (India) 
8 Gokhale Road, Kolkata-700020 
West Bengal, India. 
 
Website: www.ieindia.org

On Tue, Jul 31, 2018 at 6:00 PM, Harjeet Nath <harjeetnath@tripurauniv.in> wrote:
Thank you for the reply.

I am attaching a copy of the Pay in Slip (Enrollment Number :1706060003) issued by Tripura University to Mr.
Joydeep Das (M.Tech Student). I am also attaching a copy of 2nd semester marksheet for your kind reference.

Kindly let me know if everything is ok.

Thanks and Regards,

On Mon, Jul 30, 2018 at 4:17 PM, RESEARCH IEI <research@ieindia.org> wrote:
R.5/1/PG/2018-19  

Dear Sir/Madam,

This has reference to your trailing mail on the subject project proposal for IEI R&D Grant.

Course enrolment certificate is provided to the student by the Institute/College/University at the time of
admission to a particular course [PG/Ph.D.]. We cannot provide format for the same.

With best regards, 

IEI R&D Cell 
Technical Department 
The Institution of Engineers (India) 
8 Gokhale Road, Kolkata-700020 
West Bengal, India. 
 
Website: www.ieindia.org

On Mon, Jul 30, 2018 at 3:16 PM, Harjeet Nath <harjeetnath@tripurauniv.in> wrote:
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Thank you for the reply mail.

Can you please provide me the format of the Course Enrolment Certificate.

Else will it be ok if a scanned copy of  the previous semester marksheet and ID card of the student is provided
instead?

Kindly let me know.

Thanks and Regards,

On Mon, Jul 30, 2018 at 1:21 PM, RESEARCH IEI <research@ieindia.org> wrote:
R.5/1/PG/2018-19  

Dear Sir/Madam,

This has reference to your trailing mail on the subject project proposal for IEI R&D Grant.

Kindly provide the course Enrolment Certificate of the applicant via return mail. 

With best regards,

IEI R&D Cell 
Technical Department 
The Institution of Engineers (India) 
8 Gokhale Road, Kolkata-700020 
West Bengal, India. 

Website: www.ieindia.org

On Mon, Jul 30, 2018 at 12:34 PM, Harjeet Nath <harjeetnath@tripurauniv.in> wrote:
Sir/Madam,

With respect to your mail dated July 27th, I would like to get few clarifications regarding the following:
 

1. Is the Course Enrolment Certificate for the M.Tech student mentioned in the application? If yes then will
it be ok if I mail it or will have to post it? 

2. The appropriate breakup of the fund is already provided.A copy of it attached again with this mail.

3. The University seal is already given. It can be found in the "recommendation by Head of the University"
page where the Registrar ha signed and the seal is stamped below to it.

Kindly let me know if anything needs to be done.

Waiting for your quick and positive response.

Thanks and Regards,

Harjeet

On Fri, Jul 27, 2018 at 5:00 PM, RESEARCH IEI <research@ieindia.org> wrote:
R.5/1/PG/2018-19  

Dear Sir/Madam,

This has reference to your trailing mail on the subject project proposal for IEI R&D Grant, you are
requested to resolve the following discrepancies and re-submit your project-proposal:

1. Kindly provide the course Enrolment Certificate of the applicant. 

2.  As 12 months of 'Project Duration' is mentioned, kindly provide appropriate break-up of fund
requirement in 'Summary of Financial Requirement' section.

3. 'University Seal' is missing in the submitted proposal.
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With best regards,

IEI R&D Cell 
Technical Department 
The Institution of Engineers (India) 
8 Gokhale Road, Kolkata-700020 
West Bengal, India. 

Website: www.ieindia.org

On Fri, Jul 13, 2018 at 3:12 PM, Harjeet Nath <harjeetnath@tripurauniv.in> wrote:
Respected Sir/Madam,

Kindly check in the attached for a copy of the filled in application form for IEI Grant in Aid Scheme
from Harjeet Nath (Assistant Professor, Dept. of Chemical and Polymer Engineering, Tripura Central
University) and Joydeep Das (M.Tech Student). 2 hard copies have also been posted.

Your kind acceptance will be highly acknowledged.

Thanks and Regards,

harjeet

-- 
**********************************************************************************************
Harjeet Nath

Assistant Professor & Coordinator 
Dept. Of Chemical and Polymer Engineering 
Tripura University, Agartala, India. 
Cell: +91-9954246498

Email: harjeetnath@gmail.com, harjeetnath@tripurauniv.in

*******************************************************************************

Arise! Awake! and stop not until the goal is reached                                                                
-Swami Vivekananda

-- 
**********************************************************************************************
Harjeet Nath

Assistant Professor & Coordinator 
Dept. Of Chemical and Polymer Engineering 
Tripura University, Agartala, India. 
Cell: +91-9954246498

Email: harjeetnath@gmail.com, harjeetnath@tripurauniv.in

*******************************************************************************

Arise! Awake! and stop not until the goal is reached                                                                      
-Swami Vivekananda

-- 
**********************************************************************************************
Harjeet Nath
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Assistant Professor & Coordinator 
Dept. Of Chemical and Polymer Engineering 
Tripura University, Agartala, India. 
Cell: +91-9954246498

Email: harjeetnath@gmail.com, harjeetnath@tripurauniv.in

*******************************************************************************

Arise! Awake! and stop not until the goal is reached                                                                           
-Swami Vivekananda

-- 
**********************************************************************************************
Harjeet Nath

Assistant Professor & Coordinator 
Dept. Of Chemical and Polymer Engineering 
Tripura University, Agartala, India. 
Cell: +91-9954246498

Email: harjeetnath@gmail.com, harjeetnath@tripurauniv.in

*******************************************************************************

Arise! Awake! and stop not until the goal is reached                                                                                 
-Swami Vivekananda

Harjeet Nath <harjeetnath@tripurauniv.in> Fri, Sep 14, 2018 at 9:57 AM
To: RESEARCH IEI <research@ieindia.org>

Thank you for the update. Currently I am out of Country for a conference and will come back by 19th of this month.
After that I will enquire and start the remaining formalities.      Regards, 
[Quoted text hidden]
[Quoted text hidden]

Harjeet Nath <harjeetnath@tripurauniv.in> Wed, Sep 19, 2018 at 2:22 PM
To: RESEARCH IEI <research@ieindia.org>

Dear Sir/Madam
IEI Technical Department,

This is to confirm the receipt of Rs.25000  to the account of Tripura University under IEI R&D Grant-in-Aid scheme on
12/09/2018.

Kindly let me know the appropriate head distribution (Recurring/Non Recurring) of the total money granted for the
research project so that I can start the project accordingly .

Thanks and Regards,
[Quoted text hidden]

Harjeet Nath <harjeetnath@tripurauniv.in> Tue, Sep 25, 2018 at 1:11 PM
To: RESEARCH IEI <research@ieindia.org>

Dear Sir/Madam
IEI Technical Department,

This is to confirm the receipt of Rs.25000  to the account of Tripura University under IEI R&D Grant-in-Aid scheme on
12/09/2018.
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Kindly let me know the appropriate head distribution (Recurring/Non Recurring) of the total money granted for the
research project so that I can start the project accordingly .

Thanks and Regards,

[Quoted text hidden]

RESEARCH IEI <research@ieindia.org> Tue, Sep 25, 2018 at 1:22 PM
To: Harjeet Nath <harjeetnath@tripurauniv.in>

R.5/2/PG/2018-19/ PG2019004   
 
Dear Sir/Madam,

You are advised to utilise the sanctioned amount for the subject project on account of non-recurring expenditures
as it was mentioned in the submitted application form.

With best regards, 

IEI R&D Cell 
Technical Department 
The Institution of Engineers (India) 
8 Gokhale Road, Kolkata-700020 
West Bengal, India. 
 
Website: www.ieindia.org

[Quoted text hidden]

Harjeet Nath <harjeetnath@tripurauniv.in> Tue, Sep 25, 2018 at 2:15 PM
To: RESEARCH IEI <research@ieindia.org>

Thank you for the information. 
[Quoted text hidden]

Harjeet Nath <harjeetnath@tripurauniv.in> Mon, Jun 29, 2020 at 4:34 PM
To: Tripura University- Project Section <tu_rdsection@tripurauniv.in>

The project approval email can be found below
[Quoted text hidden]
-- 
**********************************************************************************************

Harjeet Nath 
Assistant Professor, Dept. Of Chemical and Polymer Engineering,
Tripura University (A Central University), Agartala, India.
Cell: +91-9954246498
Email: harjeetnath@gmail.com, harjeetnath@tripurauniv.in
Profile URL: https://vidwan.inflibnet.ac.in/profile/100456,
https://www.tripurauniv.ac.in/Page/departmentsDetailsHome/18-facultybiodata-124
[Quoted text hidden]
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